
SIZE QTY
Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr Part 

#
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

6" 4 Mueller $897.50 $3,590.00 AVK $1,111.20 $4,444.80  Kennedy $900.28 $3,601.12 AFC $894.80 $3,579.20

8" 4 Mueller $1,430.00 $5,720.00 AVK $1,768.26 $7,073.04  Kennedy $1,433.94 $5,735.76 AFC $1,423.80 $5,695.20

10" 1 Mueller $2,228.00 $2,228.00 AVK $2,756.82 $2,756.82  Kennedy $2,235.93 $2,235.93 AFC $2,219.60 $2,219.60

12" 1 Mueller $2,820.00 $2,820.00 AVK $3,488.22 $3,488.22  Kennedy $2,829.28 $2,829.28 AFC $2,808.80 $2,808.80

16" 1 Mueller $9,450.00 $9,450.00 AVK $12,286.24 $12,286.24  Kennedy $8,335.85 $8,335.85 AFC $9,150.00 $9,150.00

20 $23,808.00 $30,049.12 $22,737.94 $23,452.80

SIZE QTY
Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr Part 

#
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

6" 10 Ebaa 2000 $56.35 $563.50 Napac $37.20 $372.00 Sygma $44.15 $441.50 Sygma $61.80 $618.00

8" 10 Ebaa 2001 $75.25 $752.50 Napac $40.80 $408.00 Sygma $60.16 $601.60 Sygma $84.20 $842.00

10" 8 Ebaa 2002 $107.50 $860.00 Napac $56.80 $454.40 Sygma $85.55 $684.40 Sygma $119.75 $958.00

12" 4 Ebaa 2003 $142.00 $568.00 Napac $60.60 $242.40 Sygma $114.99 $459.96 Sygma $161.00 $644.00

16" 4 Ebaa 2004 $239.00 $956.00 Napac $99.00 $396.00 Sygma $198.40 $793.60 Sygma $288.85 $1,155.40

6" 10 Ebaa 2005 $65.00 $650.00 Ford $91.97 $919.70 Sygma $51.68 $516.80 Sygma $72.00 $720.00

8" 10 Ebaa 2006 $87.00 $870.00 Ford $124.19 $1,241.90 Sygma $69.72 $697.20 Sygma $97.10 $971.00

10" 8 Ebaa 2007 $147.50 $1,180.00 No Bid No Bid Sygma $120.75 $966.00 Sygma $169.00 $1,352.00

12" 4 Ebaa 2008 $155.00 $620.00 No Bid No Bid Sygma $126.70 $506.80 Sygma $177.50 $710.00

16" 4 Ebaa 2009 $299.00 $1,196.00 No Bid No Bid Sygma $249.60 $998.40 Sygma $330.00 $1,320.00

20 $8,216.00 $4,034.40 $6,666.26 $9,290.40

BID GROUP 2

MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT 

PACK FOR D.I. & PVC PIPE

Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for DI 

Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts:

Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for DI 

Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts:

Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for DI 

Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts:

Sub-Total

GATE VALVES

Resilient Wedge Gate Valve, Open 

Right, Mueller or approved equal:

Resilient Wedge Gate Valve, Open 

Right, Mueller or approved equal:

Resilient Wedge Gate Valve, Open 

Right, Mueller or approved equal:

Resilient Wedge Gate Valve, Open 

Right, Mueller or approved equal:

Resilient Wedge Gate Valve, Open 

Right, Mueller or approved equal:

Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for C-900 

Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts:

Sub-Total

Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for DI 

Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts:

Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for DI 

Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts:

Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for C-900 

Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts:

Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for C-900 

Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts:

Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for C-900 

Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts:

Restraint MJ Accessory Pack for C-900 

Fittings with Gland, Gaskets & Bolts:

Putnam PipeJohn Hoadley & Sons
BID GROUP 1

Ti-Sales
Bid Opening:  7/11/2024 @ 2:00 PM

IFB 25-4
Sudbury Water District

Miscellaneous Waterworks Supplies

E.J. Prescott



SIZE QTY
Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr Part 

#
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

6" x 1" 5 Smith Blair $17.50 $87.50 Smith Blair $55.15 $275.75 No Bid No Bid Romac $95.00 $475.00

8" x 1" 5 Smith Blair $21.00 $105.00 Smith Blair $60.22 $301.10 No Bid No Bid Romac $114.00 $570.00

10" x 1" 2 Smith Blair $26.00 $52.00 Smith Blair $77.83 $155.66 No Bid No Bid Romac $127.00 $254.00

12" x 1" 2 Smith Blair $28.00 $56.00 Smith Blair $93.36 $186.72 No Bid No Bid Romac $149.00 $298.00

16" x 1" 1 Smith Blair $94.00 $94.00 Smith Blair $150.07 $150.07 No Bid No Bid Romac $298.00 $298.00

20 $394.50 $1,069.30 No Bid $1,895.00

SIZE QTY
Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr Part 

#
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

¾” 2 No Bid No Bid Blue $0.57 $114.00 Endot $41.00 $82.00 Flying W $40.00 $80.00

1” 4 No Bid No Bid Blue $0.93 $372.00 Endot $66.00 $264.00 Flying W $70.00 $280.00

20 No Bid $486.00 $346.00 $360.00

SIZE QTY
Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

6" 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid US Pipe $29.92 $2,992.00 ACIP $33.50 $3,350.00

8" 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid US Pipe $42.22 $4,222.00 ACIP $47.25 $4,725.00

10" 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid US Pipe $55.24 $1,104.80 ACIP $62.00 $1,240.00

12" 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid US Pipe $69.68 $2,787.20 ACIP $78.00 $3,120.00

16" 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid US Pipe $97.50 $1,950.00 ACIP $113.00 $2,260.00

20 No Bid No Bid $13,056.00 $14,695.00

SIZE QTY
Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr Part 

#
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

6" 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid National PVC $12.40 $1,240.00 IPEX $16.20 $1,620.00

8" 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid National PVC $21.30 $2,130.00 IPEX $27.75 $2,775.00

10" 80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid National PVC $30.40 $2,432.00 IPEX $41.70 $3,336.00

12" 120 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid National PVC $42.50 $5,100.00 IPEX $58.65 $7,038.00

16" 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid National PVC $57.25 $2,290.00 IPEX $92.50 $3,700.00

20 No Bid No Bid $13,192.00 $18,469.00

Sub-Total

Ductile Iron Pipe Class 52 CL (Per Foot):

Ductile Iron Pipe Class 52 CL (Per Foot):

Sub-Total

BID GROUP 6

POLYVINYL CHLORIDE PVC PIPE 

(C900)

BID GROUP 5

DUCTILE IRON PIPE 

Ductile Iron Pipe Class 52 CL (Per Foot):

Ductile Iron Pipe Class 52 CL (Per Foot):

Ductile Iron Pipe Class 52 CL (Per Foot):

CC Service Saddle, Single Strap, Epoxy 

Coated, Romac or approved equal:

BID GROUP 3

SERVICE SADDLES w/ CC 

THREAD

CC Service Saddle, Single Strap, Epoxy 

Coated, Romac or approved equal:

C-900 Pipe (Per Foot):

C-900 Pipe (Per Foot):

C-900 Pipe (Per Foot):

C-900 Pipe (Per Foot):

C-900 Pipe (Per Foot):

Sub-Total

Putnam PipeJohn Hoadley & Sons Ti-Sales E.J. Prescott

BID GROUP 4

POLYETHYLENE (PE) TUBING

PE Tubing (Per 100' Roll):

PE Tubing (Per 100' Roll):

Sub-Total

CC Service Saddle, Single Strap, Epoxy 

Coated, Romac or approved equal:

CC Service Saddle, Single Strap, Epoxy 

Coated, Romac or approved equal:

CC Service Saddle, Single Strap, Epoxy 

Coated, Romac or approved equal:



SIZE QTY
Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr Part 

#
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

6" 10 Mueller/Hymax $274.00 $2,740.00 Smith Blair $255.00 $2,550.00 Ford $292.70 $2,927.00 Romac Macro $330.00 $3,300.00

8" 10 Mueller/Hymax $309.00 $3,090.00 Smith Blair $287.00 $2,870.00 Ford $330.50 $3,305.00 Romac Macro $372.10 $3,721.00

10" 6 Mueller/Hymax $398.00 $2,388.00 Smith Blair $398.00 $2,388.00 Ford $434.90 $2,609.40 Romac Macro $478.70 $2,872.20

12" 6 Mueller/Hymax $485.00 $2,910.00 Smith Blair $535.00 $3,210.00 Ford $626.90 $3,761.40 Romac Macro $565.00 $3,390.00

16" 2 Mueller/Hymax $1,200.00 $2,400.00 Smith Blair $1,140.00 $2,280.00 Hymax Style $1,375.00 $2,750.00 Romac Macro $1,625.00 $3,250.00

20 $13,528.00 $13,298.00 $15,352.80 $16,533.20

SIZE QTY
Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr Part 

#
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

6" 4 Smith Blair $89.00 $356.00 Smith Blair $184.83 $739.32 No Bid No Bid Romac $216.15 $864.60

8" 6 Smith Blair $107.00 $642.00 Smith Blair $221.37 $1,328.22 No Bid No Bid Romac $254.55 $1,527.30

10" 4 Smith Blair $127.00 $508.00 Smith Blair $261.36 $1,045.44 No Bid No Bid Romac $331.60 $1,326.40

12" 4 Smith Blair $148.00 $592.00 Smith Blair $305.43 $1,221.72 No Bid No Bid Romac $384.30 $1,537.20

16" 2 Smith Blair $333.00 $666.00 Smith Blair $453.72 $907.44 No Bid No Bid Romac $853.05 $1,706.10

6" 4 Smith Blair $104.00 $416.00 Smith Blair $214.79 $859.16 No Bid No Bid Romac $238.40 $953.60

8" 6 Smith Blair $128.00 $768.00 Smith Blair $263.78 $1,582.68 No Bid No Bid Romac $290.90 $1,745.40

10" 4 Smith Blair $160.00 $640.00 Smith Blair $329.38 $1,317.52 No Bid No Bid Romac $381.00 $1,524.00

12" 4 Smith Blair $184.00 $736.00 Smith Blair $378.53 $1,514.12 No Bid No Bid Romac $534.60 $2,138.40

16" 2 Smith Blair $380.00 $760.00 Smith Blair $519.67 $1,039.34 No Bid No Bid Romac $1,106.40 $2,212.80

20 $6,084.00 $11,554.96 No Bid $15,535.80

BID GROUP 7

REPAIR COUPLING

Two Bolt Ductile Iron Coupling with 

Handle, Hymax 2 or equal:

BID GROUP 8

FULL CIRCLE REAIR CLAMP

12.5" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, 

Smith-Blair or equal:

12.5" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, 

Smith-Blair or equal:

12.5" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, 

Smith-Blair or equal:

12.5" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, 

Smith-Blair or equal:

Two Bolt Ductile Iron Coupling with 

Handle, Hymax 2 or equal:

Two Bolt Ductile Iron Coupling with 

Handle, Hymax 2 or equal:

Two Bolt Ductile Iron Coupling with 

Handle, Hymax 2 or equal:

Two Bolt Ductile Iron Coupling with 

Handle, Hymax 2 or equal:

Sub-Total

Sub-Total

15" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, 

Smith-Blair or equal:

15" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, 

Smith-Blair or equal:

15" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, 

Smith-Blair or equal:

15" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, 

Smith-Blair or equal:

15" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, 

Smith-Blair or equal:

20" Overall Length, Stainless Steel, 

Smith-Blair or equal:

John Hoadley & Sons Ti-Sales Putnam Pipe E.J. Prescott



SIZE QTY
Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr Part 

#
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

4 ½” to 5 

½”
30 Bingham & Taylor $104.00 $3,120.00 Clow $87.60 $2,628.00 Bibby $53.90 $1,617.00 No Bid No Bid

6" 20 Bingham & Taylor $21.50 $430.00 Clow $39.33 $786.60 Bibby $17.49 $349.80 No Bid No Bid

30" 30 Bingham & Taylor $34.00 $1,020.00 Clow $42.00 $1,260.00 Bibby $18.76 $562.80 No Bid No Bid

6' 10 Bingham & Taylor $347.00 $3,470.00 Clow $258.04 $2,580.40 Bibby $224.00 $2,240.00 No Bid No Bid

1" 30 Bingham & Taylor $13.00 $390.00 Clow $15.14 $454.20 Bibby $14.50 $435.00 No Bid No Bid

1.5" 30 Bingham & Taylor $17.50 $525.00 Clow $20.20 $606.00 Bibby $15.68 $470.40 No Bid No Bid

2" 30 Bingham & Taylor $19.50 $585.00 Clow $25.25 $757.50 Bibby $19.04 $571.20 No Bid No Bid

4" 30 Bingham & Taylor $48.00 $1,440.00 Clow $50.48 $1,514.40 Bibby $32.48 $974.40 No Bid No Bid

6" 30 Bingham & Taylor $80.00 $2,400.00 Clow $55.53 $1,665.90 Bibby $49.28 $1,478.40 No Bid No Bid

30 Bingham & Taylor $20.00 $600.00 Clow $33.09 $992.70 Bibby $22.60 $678.00 No Bid No Bid

20 $13,980.00 $13,245.70 $9,377.00 No Bid

BURY QTY
Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr Part 

#
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

6' 10 Mueller 3225 $32,250.00 AVK 3687 $36,870.00 Kennedy 3330 $33,300.00 AFC B84 3378 $33,780.00

5 ½” 10 Mueller 3160 $31,600.00 AVK 3609 $36,090.00 Kennedy 3260 $32,600.00 AFC B85 3305 $33,050.00

20 $63,850.00 $72,960.00 $65,900.00 $66,830.00

BID GROUP 9

CURB BOX, MAIN GATE VALVE BOX, 

AND COVERS

Erie Style Curb Box with Centering Rod

Curb Box (Erie) Extension:

Stainless-Steel Centering Rod:

Cast Iron Main Gate Valve Box with 

Cover :

Sub-Total

BID GROUP 10

FIRE HYDRANTS

Open Right, 5 ¼” Hydrant (Red):

Open Right, 5 ¼” Hydrant (Red):

Main Gate Box Extension:

Main Gate Box Extension:

Main Gate Box Extension:

Main Gate Box Extension:

Main Gate Box Extension:

Main Gate Box Cover:

Sub-Total

John Hoadley & Sons Ti-Sales Putnam Pipe E.J. Prescott



SIZE QTY
Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr 

Part #
UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED BID 

AMOUNT

Mfr & Mfr Part 

#
UNIT PRICE EXTENDED BID AMOUNT

1 x ¾” 10 No Bid No Bid Midland $11.34 $113.40 No Bid No Bid McDonald $9.80 $98.00

¾” 10 No Bid No Bid Midland $20.70 $207.00 No Bid No Bid McDonald $8.00 $80.00

¾” 20 No Bid No Bid Midland $7.02 $140.40 No Bid No Bid McDonald $6.10 $122.00

1" 20 No Bid No Bid Midland $10.82 $216.40 No Bid No Bid McDonald $9.45 $189.00

¾” 40 No Bid No Bid Ford $17.94 $717.60 No Bid No Bid McDonald $12.70 $508.00

1" 10 No Bid No Bid Ford $27.62 $276.20 No Bid No Bid McDonald $19.55 $195.50

¾” 10 No Bid No Bid Ford $26.38 $263.80 No Bid No Bid McDonald $22.15 $221.50

1" 10 No Bid No Bid Ford $37.62 $376.20 No Bid No Bid McDonald $31.70 $317.00

¾” 10 No Bid No Bid Ford $17.94 $179.40 No Bid No Bid McDonald $12.70 $127.00

1" 10 No Bid No Bid Ford $26.84 $268.40 No Bid No Bid McDonald $19.55 $195.50

¾” 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Watts $455.45 $910.90

1" 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Watts $610.80 $1,221.60

¾” 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $63.16 $1,263.20 No Bid No Bid McDonald $72.85 $1,457.00

1" 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $141.41 $2,828.20 No Bid No Bid McDonald $110.00 $2,200.00

¾” 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $66.21 $1,324.20 No Bid No Bid McDonald $97.25 $1,945.00

1" 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $151.33 $3,026.60 No Bid No Bid McDonald $138.25 $2,765.00

¾” 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $110.19 $2,203.80 No Bid No Bid McDonald $87.40 $1,748.00

1" 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $161.08 $3,221.60 No Bid No Bid McDonald $127.00 $2,540.00

¾” 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $81.09 $1,621.80 No Bid No Bid McDonald $65.80 $1,316.00

1" 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $198.17 $3,963.40 No Bid No Bid McDonald $127.50 $2,550.00

¾” 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $110.92 $2,218.40 No Bid No Bid McDonald $80.90 $1,618.00

1” 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $166.74 $3,334.80 No Bid No Bid McDonald $121.60 $2,432.00

¾” 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $81.05 $1,621.00 No Bid No Bid McDonald $60.00 $1,200.00

1” 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $106.57 $2,131.40 No Bid No Bid McDonald $78.75 $1,575.00

1" 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $27.80 $556.00 No Bid No Bid McDonald $28.00 $560.00

1" 20 No Bid No Bid Ford $29.74 $594.80 No Bid No Bid McDonald $28.50 $570.00

¾” 30 No Bid No Bid Ford $30.58 $917.40 No Bid No Bid McDonald $30.00 $900.00

¾” x 1” 30 No Bid No Bid Ford $35.54 $1,066.20 No Bid No Bid McDonald $35.00 $1,050.00

1” 30 No Bid No Bid Ford $34.98 $1,049.40 No Bid No Bid McDonald $35.00 $1,050.00

20 No Bid $41,569.40 No Bid $35,825.00

$70,328.50 $13,298.00 $65,375.20 $35,825.00

Angle Ball Valve with Handle:

Awarded sub group category
Mathematical error adjustment

Incomplete Bid Category

3/4" Meter 

x 1" Comp

Meter Adaptor (Straight):

Meter Adaptor (Bent):

Meter Adaptor (Bent):

BID GROUP 11

WATERWORKS BRASS

Reducer Coupling:

Street Elbow:

Angle Ball Valve with Handle:

Angle Ball Valve P.J.C. x Meter Nut with 

Handle:

Compression Union:

Compression Union:

Compression Union:

Sub-Total

Total Contract Award

Curb Stop Compression:

Curb Stop Compression:

Corporation Stop Compression x C.C. 

Thread:

Corporation Stop Compression x C.C. 

Thread:
Union Adaptor - 1" Compression x 3/4" 

M.I.P.:
Union Adaptor- 1" - Compression x 1" 

M.I.P.:

No Bid

1" Meter x 

1" Comp
No Bid No Bid Ford $190.74

No Bid No BidFord $102.68

$3,814.80

No Bid

Straight Type Ball Valve Flared x F.I.P. 

with Handle:

Straight Type Ball Valve Flared x F.I.P. 

with Handle:

Straight Type Ball Valve F.I.P. x Meter 

Nut with Hande:

Straight Type Ball Valve F.I.P. x Meter 

Nut with Hande:

Meter Adaptor (Straight):

20

20 $2,550.00No Bid No Bid

McDonald $80.65 $1,613.00

McDonald $127.50

John Hoadley & Sons Ti-Sales Putnam Pipe E.J. Prescott

Witnessed by: Vincent Roy and Renee Adams

$2,053.60

Angle Ball Valve P.J.C. x Meter Nut with 

Handle:

Meter Adaptor (Short):

Meter Adaptor (Short):

Reduced Pressure Backflow Preventor 

with Ball Valves:

Reduced Pressure Backflow Preventor 

with Ball Valves:

Straight Type Ball Valve F.I.P. x F.I.P. 

with Handle:

Straight Type Ball Valve F.I.P. x F.I.P. 

with Handle:

Elbow - F.I.P. x F.I.P. (90°):

Elbow - F.I.P. x F.I.P. (90°):


